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Subject of the Grievance
This case concerns a Written Reminder issued to an Electric Crew Foreman for failing to
report to a mandatory pre-arranged overtime assignment.

Facts of the Case
On Tuesday, December 2ih, the Electric T&D employees in the Oakport yard were notified
that a crew would be needed for Sunday January 1". On the following day the supervisor
wrote on dry erase board the names of the employees who would be required to work the
assignment if there were insufficient volunteers. The grievant's name was one of the names
listed. Following this, the supervisor and the grievant had a discussion regarding the
assignment. The supervisor wanted to make sure the grievant understood that he was
obligated to work the assignment. The supervisor further told the grievant that he would not
force the upgrade of a Lineman to take the place of the grievant.

On Thursday, the grievant called in sick. On Friday, the grievant called in and left a voice
message requesting a Floating Holiday. Upon hearing the voice message that day, the
supervisor texted the grievant telling him that he was expected to report for the New Year's
Day overtime assignment. The grievant read the text on either Friday or Saturday. The
grievant did not respond to the supervisor's text and did not report for the Sunday overtime
assignment.

During the Local Investigating Committee, the grievant stated that when he left work on
Wednesday, he believed he had not yet been forced to work the overtime. The supervisor
had told him he would be forced if there were insufficient volunteers. Since employees had
until Thursday to volunteer, it was possible that he did not need to work.
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Discussion
At the earlier stages of the grievance procedure the Union had argued that in accordance
with Subsection 208.6(b) of the Physical Labor Agreement, an employee who is off due to
illness or injury shall not be scheduled to work overtime until the employee returns to work on
a regular workday. Since the grievant had not returned to work following his sick day he
should not have been required to report to the overtime assignment and should not have be
disciplined for failing to do so.

In regard to the Union's argument that the employee should not have been required to work
the overtime assignment, the Company pointed to Fact Finding Decision 2651-83-72(a). In
that precedent setting settlement, the parties agreed that an employee who takes a Floating
Holiday is considered available for overtime and is obligated to respond. Given that the
grievant took a Floating Holiday on Friday, he was considered as available, contractually
eligible and obligated to respond.

The issue before the Pre-Review Committee is whether the disciplinary action taken for
failing to report was for just cause. It is clear from the record that the grievant was made
aware of the expectation to work the overtime. This was communicated to him before he left
work and following his voice message requesting a Floating Holiday. If the grievant was
unable to report due to illness, he had an obligation to contact his supervisor.

The Committee agrees the grievant was obligated to report as agreed to in Fact Finding
Decision 2651-83-72(a).

Decision
The Committee agrees the discipline was issued for just cause and closes this grievance
without adjustment.
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