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Subject of the Grievance. '.
This case concerns whether the Company was required to follow the Utilization of Relief
Service Operators Clarification and the Hours of Relief Service Operators Clarification (Relief
Agreement) when a Service Operator went home sick during his shift. The Company did not
believe the Reli~f Agreement applied since the need was for less than an entir~ work period.
The Company considered it an overtime assignment and used the call out list, calling out a
Service Operator. .

Facts of the Case
On Saturday, May 24, 2003, a Service Operator assigned to work from 10:00 a.m. - 8:00
p.m. became ill during his shift. He worked from 10:00 a.m. until approximately 1:00 p.m.
and then went home. The Company utilized the overtime list and called out the Service
Operator with the least overtime to fill the remaining shift. The Union grieved on behalf of a
Relief Service Operator who was on his Regular Day Off (ROO).

Discussion
The P-RC Committee reviewed Section 205.3 of the Physical Labor Agreement and the
Relief Agreement. The Committee agreed that Relief Service Operators have first priority
when replacing an absent employee for a work period. There is no argument that had the
Service Operator called in sick before his shift and the Company decided to fill his shift,
available Relief Service Operators would be considered before Service Operators. The issue
in this grievance is whether this same preference applies when filling a partial work period.

The Company pointed out that the Relief Agreement is a clarification of the language in
Section 208.20. The Relief Agreement was written for use in providing relief for a work
period. Section 208.20 and the Relief Clarification define a work period as "any eight hour
shift or extension thereof". If the Company is filling a partial work period (as in this grievance)
then it is considered and paid as an overtime assignment and the Relief Agreement is not
applicable. "Work period" is referred to over 25 times in the clarification. "Partial work



period" in never mentioned. The Company also pointed out that this same issue had been
grieved three years earlier at this same headquarters. The parties agreed at Fact Finding
that since the shift was vacated during the shift, the Relief Agreement was not applicable and
therefore Relief Service Operators did not have preference for the assignment. .

The Union argued, that the intent of the language is to give preference to Relief Service
Operators when filling in for absent employees. The Relief Agreement's reference to "work
period" is generic and not intended to imply applicability to full work periods, but not partial
work periods.

Given that the Relief Agreement language does not specifically address the situation at
hand, the Committee conducted a survey of the supervisors throughout the Company. With'
the exception of the headquarters involved, all respondents indicated that they would call out
a Relief Service Operator before going to the overtime list when an employee goes home
sick during a shift. ,

Decision
The Committee agrees that the Relief Agreement is applicable when the Company ~ecides
to fill the remainder of shift that is vacated during the shift. As such, available Relief Service
,Operators should be considered before Service Operators. There will be no bypass pay in
this case as local supervision was following the procedure that the parties had previously
agreed to. .
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