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Subject of the Grievance
This case concerns the discharge of a Compliance Inspector for falsifying Company records
by indicating he inspected underground enclosures which he had not inspected.

Facts of the Case
The grievant is a Compliance Inspector with 9 years of service. At the time of the incident
the grievant had no active disciplinary action.

The Company conducted a system-wide audit and quality assurance review of compliance
inspection reports after it was reveled that some inspection reports had been falsified. As a
result of this investigation, it was determined that the grievant falsified inspection reports for
multiple underground enclosures. A Company member of the Inspection Review Committee
provided the Local Investigating Committee (L1C) with details regarding the enclosures
including the factors which were considered. Based on the review, it was determined that the
grievant had not opened the enclosures.

During the Local Investigating Committee (L1C), the grievant stated that he opened and
inspected all the enclosures in question. He stated he believed he was being set up but did
not elaborate. He also stated that the vegetation could have grown back in between the time
of the two inspections.

Discussion
The Review Committee reviewed in detail, the report on each of the enclosures. Factors
used by the Company in determining whether the enclosures had been opened included
items such as dirt and vegetation coverage, condition of bolts, existence of washers, and
physical obstructions.
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The Union argued that the amount of time between the initial inspection and the re-inspection
could account for conditions at the time of re-inspection. Much of the vegetation could be
attributed to the growth which would have occurred during inclement weather between the
original inspection and the re-inspection. The dirt covering the lids could also be attributed to
natural change over time.

The Company responded that the investigation was very rigorous and the evidence is
compelling. In one situation the 42 days which passed between the inspections could not
account for the vegetation, compacted dirt, and moss. In another situation, there was 24
inches of dirt over an enclosure which the grievant claimed to have inspected 5 months
earlier. Additionally, the existence of rusted bolts and lack of washers is further evidence that
the grievant did not open the enclosures.

The Committee reviewed a landscaping bill in connection with this case that supports the
conclusion that the grievant falsified inspections records.

Decision
The Committee agrees the discharge was for just cause and closes this case without
adjustment.
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